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TNU Sports Scores 
Men’s Basketball (10-5) 

Jan. 3-4 Trojan Boosters 
Endowment Classic 

1-3-03 
TNU 89 
Shorter College 69 

1-4-03 
TNU 65 
Olivet Nazarene 67 

1-7-03 
TNU 100 
Dillard University 73 

1-11-03 
TNU 72 
Lambuth University 67 

1-18-03 
TNU 69 
Martin Methodist 57 

Women’s Basketball (14-2) 
1-3-03 
TNU 86 
Flagler College 67 

1-4-03 
TNU 80 
Edward Waters College 64 

1-9-03 
TNU 80 
Blue Mountain College 68 

1-11-03 
TNU 70 
Lyon College 73 

1-18-03 
TNU 67 
Martin Methodist 61 

TNU welcomes 
by Lori Peach 

M3 Conference 
An exciting event for the 

Church of the Nazarene will 
be hosted at Opryland Ho¬ 
tel and Convention Center. 
February 17-19 the Mid- 
Quadrennial Conference on 
Missions and Evangelism “ 
Millennium Three” is com¬ 
ing to town. 

The conference is not just 
for pastors and ministers. 
Three days of informative 
workshops and inspiring 
worship services with some 
well-known speakers and 
musicians are expected. 

Dr. Rick Rigsby, who led 
an unforgettable, enthusias¬ 
tic sermon at the Nazarene 
Youth Congress in 1999 in 
Toronto, Canada, will be the 
guest speaker on Tuesday 
night. Other featured speak¬ 
ers include: 

Sam Vassel, pastor of 
Bronx Bethany Church of 
the Nazarene in New York 
City, NY. 

Lee Strobel, author of the 
best selling The Case for 
Christ, The Case for Faith, 
and Inside the Mind of Un¬ 
churched Harry and Mary. 

Thom Rainer, Founder 
and President of the Rainer 
Church Consulting Group 

IYK) millenniumt:hree 
The Mid-Quadrennial Conference on Missions and Evangelism 

February 17-19, 2033 * Nashville, Tennessee 

and author or co-author of 
twelve books in the church. 

Marilyn Laszlo, a former 
missionary to the Sepik 
Iwam people of Papua New 
Guinea for 23 years and cur¬ 
rent national speaker for 
Wycliffe U.S.A. 

Leonard Sweet, a fore¬ 
most expert in church rela¬ 
tions in a post-modern age, 
a historian of American cul¬ 
ture, church futurist, and a 
preacher and writer. 

Special music groups will 
also be performing for the 
conference including the 
six-time Dove gospel music 
group, the Martins, two- 
time Grammy Award nomi¬ 
nee, Wintley Phipps, and 
the up and coming Christian 
music group MJK, who 

have long been a part of the 
Trevecca Community. 

Not only will there be 
worship services, but the 
days will be filled with a 
large variety of different 

workshops and exhibits that 
are sure to meet the needs 
of everyone. The topics of 
the workshops range from 
Communication, Compas¬ 
sion Evangelism, and 

Dr. Reed meets the Milly Mobile 
by Jan Rothman 

Social Life has done it yet 
again. In honor of Trevecca 
President, Millard Reed, 
Trevecca student Eli 
Hamilton was commis¬ 
sioned to paint an old white 
Chevette that once sat in 
Benson Parking Lot. 

Lovingly termed the 
“Milly Mobile”, the newly 
painted car made its debut 
at the 2002 Trevecca Home¬ 
coming Parade as the Social 
Life float driven by Vice 
President of Social Life 
David Graham. 

The car had graced the 
Benson lot for quite some 
time until David Graham re¬ 
quested campus security to 
put a thirty day notice on the 
car. When no one else 
claimed ownership of the 

•« 

continued on page four... 
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Aleks program doesn’t add up 
I should probably begin 

this article stating with a 
mixture of pride and shame 
"I AM NOT GOOD IN 
MATH”. 

There. I've said it. The 
fact of the matter is, that as 
an inexperienced and impres¬ 
sionable child, mathematics 
held no excitement and in¬ 
trigue for me. However, if 
you asked me to pump out a 
five page paper on how the 
roles of society have been 
portrayed throughout litera¬ 
ture, I'm your girl. But alas, 
that isn't going to help me 
figure out how to balance my 
checkbook. 

So, as you can probably 
guess, by the ripe young age 
of nine, I decided that math 
was completely pointless and 
therefore I was no longer go¬ 
ing to bother myself with it. 

Not only that, but I also 
concluded that I hated math 
with every passion and fiber 
within my being. And it 
seems that I am not the only 
student to come to this con¬ 
clusion. 

According to the U.S. Sec¬ 
retary of Education Terrel 
Bell, "In mathematics, veri¬ 
fication has come primarily 
from national and interna¬ 
tional assessments showing 
that U.S. students lack nec¬ 
essary skills for solving 

multi-step problems required 
to function in the context of 
everyday situations and work 
settings." 

The truth is that many stu¬ 

dents, in high school as well 
as college, have been taught 
virtually no mathematical 
skills. 

Well now that I am older 
and wiser, I realize, looking 
back on my decision, that it 
wasn't a very good one. So to 
make a long story short, I 
struggled in math throughout 
school, only pulling my 
weight around enough to 
scrounge up a C or two. 

Even on the math portion 
of the ACT I struggled, fig¬ 
uring that only by a miracu¬ 
lous act of God would I pass. 
When all was said and done 
and the dust had cleared, I 
had received an 18. 

Needless to say, I threw 
myself a party, thrilled that I 
at least had made a score that 
was close to my age! 

When I enrolled as a 
bright-eyed, innocent fresh¬ 
man, I signed up for classes 
and was placed, due to my 
ACT score, in Developmen¬ 

tal Math 0950. Upon check¬ 
ing out the TNU Student 
Handbook (which I know ev¬ 
eryone reads on a daily ba¬ 
sis) the course was described 
as follows in a direct quote 
from the 2001-2002 edition: 

"Designed to prepare stu¬ 
dents for college level math¬ 
ematics. Material will en¬ 
compass basic skills and el¬ 
ementary algebra, depending 
on the needs of the students. 
Institutional credit but no 

credit toward graduation." 
Now while the TNU Stu¬ 

dent Handbook is incredibly 
helpful, it does not state how 
the class will be taught. I as¬ 
sumed, since it was a reme¬ 
dial course, that it would 
most likely be taught out of 
a high school algebra book, 
taking it slowly but surely, 

making sure every student 
understood the material. 

This is NOT the case. 
Imagine my surprise, when 
showing up for my first day 
of math class, armed with my 
trusty calculator and number 
2 pencil in hand, I found my¬ 
self in a computer lab. 

I thought maybe, since I 
was only a freshman, that 
when I had asked for direc¬ 
tions to class the upperclass¬ 
man would think it would be 
hilarious to give me the 
wrong ones and send me to 
the computer lab. My profes¬ 
sor informed me that I was 
indeed, in the correct class¬ 
room and that the Develop¬ 
mental Math was not a course 
taught by a professor, but in¬ 
stead a course taught by a 
computer. 

The tutorial used to teach 
Developmental Math here at 
Trevecca is through the 
Internet. So I logged in to 
http://www.highed.aleks.com 
to take the opening tutorial, 
the one that would place me 
in the program based on my 
level of skill and knowledge. 

It sounded relatively easy, 
that is, until I started the math 
part. Recall with me, if you 
will, the fact that I have al¬ 
ready stated "I AM NOT 
GOOD IN MATH". 

Now fast forward to the 
here and now. I am currently 

still enrolled in Developmen¬ 
tal Math, going on my fourth 
semester, and I am beyond 
frustrated. Actually, frus¬ 
trated doesn't even begin to 
cover it. I have had to enroll 
in the same class for two 
years straight and have had 
to pay for it every time. 

I've wasted time repeating 
this course, when I could be 
using the credit hours to be 
taking classes that actually 

continued on page 3... 

Is there a pressing 
issue or thought 

provoking opinion 
you wish to voice? 
Write a letter to the 

editor at: 

333 Murfreesboro Road 
Nashville, TN 37210 

(615) 259-7159 

anonymous letters will 
not be printed. 

“The problem is that the tutorial 
skips some steps in explaining 
problems, leaving the confused 

student trying to figure out 
what is going on... ” 

Who’s Social Life is it? 
by Quintaria Brunson 

After attending this school 
for two years, I have become 
quite perturbed by the obvi¬ 
ous partitions here at 
Trevecca. I am compelled to 
speak out about one of the 
non-inclusive episodes that 
occur on this campus daily. 

The planning of student ac¬ 
tivities by S.G.A. and Social 
Life members is, by far, not 
the collaboration of ideas it 
should be. The picture of 
Trevecca’s social planning is 
rather ludicrous. A small 
group of simple-minded in¬ 
dividuals sit on the Acropo¬ 
lis and plan unscrupulous 

events for us mortals. I have 
sat quietly long enough while 
this repetition of events has 
occurred, and it is time for 
this dysfunctional council to 
either get with the program 
or get ran over. 

The choice is yours. 
Frankly speaking, these boot¬ 
leg, childish, half-cocked ac¬ 
tivities are simply absurd. 

“ The activities do not in¬ 
terest me. They are very ju¬ 
venile because of all the re¬ 
strictions placed on us by the 
school.” stated Trevecca stu¬ 
dent David Janosik. 

“The activities planned by 
S.G.A. are of interest to only 
S.G.A.” said Nicole Davis, 
another student here at 

Trevecca. 
Those parties responsible 

for planning student events 
have an obligation to encom¬ 
pass the ideas of the overall 
student body, and that has not 
been achieved nor attempted. 

All too many students feel 
their opinions are uninvited, 
unwelcomed, and unwanted. 
The negligence to acknowl¬ 
edge a variety of ideas has 
caused a rift among our stu¬ 
dents here. 

The absence of consider¬ 
ation for athletes, fellow stu¬ 
dents, and minorities have 
mounted into enormous 
amounts of complaints. 

Lynnette Greer, a Trevecca 
athlete, stated “Most activi¬ 

ties planned conflict with 
sports scheduling, so I can¬ 
not attend them.” 

“The Social Life and 
S.G.A. activities are geared 
towards white students, and 
minority opinions are not 

considered. If there are any 
culturally diverse events, 
they are only sponsored by 
the Cultural Club.” David 
Burger said. 

Nate Knight stated, “Some 
activities are all right, but 
most are pointless.” 

In a nutshell, S.G.A. and 
Social Lifers, grow up, get 
interesting, and please sup¬ 
press the looks of repulsion 
when suggestions are made 
by unsatisfied students. Bot¬ 
tom Line: If you did not learn 
to appreciate others at home, 
you will learn now. The col¬ 
lege experience is for all, not 
a select few, so embrace all 
when planning events for stu¬ 
dents here at Trevecca. 

“The college experience is 
for all, not a select few... ’’ 
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Vienna Choir Boys to visit Trevecca 

For approximately the 
past five hundred years, the 
Vienna Choir Boys have 
been touring the world as 
one of the most respected 
musical groups in history. 

Now, on Thursday, Janu¬ 
ary 23rd, 2003, Trevecca 
Community Church has the 
honor of hosting this world- 
renowned group. 

Half a millennium ago, 
upon the transfer of his 
court from Innsbruck to 
Vienna, Hapsburg Emperor 
Maximilian I demanded that 
there always be six boys 
among his personal court 
musicians. Historians have 
since settled on the year 
1498 as the official found¬ 
ing date of the group the 
world has come to know 
simply as the Vienna Choir 
Boys. 

For the next four hundred 
years, the boys were com¬ 
missioned to sing exclu¬ 
sively for the Hapsburg 
dynasty's court at events 
such as masses, private con¬ 
certs, and other state occa¬ 
sions. 

After the breakdown of 
the Hapsburg Empire in 
1918, the boys' choir sur¬ 
vived because of the work 
of Dean of the Imperial 
Chapel, Josef Schnitt. 

In its entirety, the choir 
consists of about one hun¬ 
dred choristers between the 
ages of ten and fourteen. 

This group is then divided 
into four touring choirs, one 
of whom Trevecca will be 
pleased to present this 
Thursday. 

The Vienna Choir Boys 
sings primarily on the con¬ 
tinent of Europe, however 
they are frequent guests in 
Asia and Australia, as well 

continued on page 4... 

Students can’t count on developmental math program 

continued from page 2 

count towards my gradua¬ 
tion. 

As it is, I am already over 
six credit hours short of 
where I should actually be. 
And as bad as the situation 
may seem, it gets worse. I 
didn't actually think it could, 
but it does. 

While I was at home dur¬ 
ing Christmas break, I re¬ 
ceived a lovely letter from 
Trevecca, informing me that 
I was being placed on aca¬ 
demic suspension due to my 
failure to complete Develop¬ 
mental Math. So I returned to 
TNU this semester, not even 
knowing if I was returning to 
stay, or if I would be forced 
to leave. 

Now, for those of you un¬ 
familiar to the suspension 
process, let me shed some in¬ 
sight on the subject. If you 
are suspended, you must first 
write a letter of appeal to the 
Academic Appeal Commit¬ 
tee. Then this committee gets 

together to review your case, 
and they decide whether or 
not the suspension will be 
lifted. If it is, hooray. If not, 
then you must meet the re¬ 
quirements in order to re-en¬ 
roll for the semester. 

The requirements placed 
upon me were to take a final 
ALEKS assessment and pass 
it with a minimum of 75%. 
If that did not happen, I 

would have to leave TNU and 
wait to re-enroll for the Fall 
2003 semester. 

Enter in here the problems 
with the ALEKS math tuto¬ 
rial. The problem is that the 
tutorial skips some steps in 
explaining problems, leaving 
the confused student (that 
would be me) trying to fig¬ 
ure out what is going on and 
how the answer was reached. 
Thankfully, I had reached 
70% before Christmas, so at 
least I had a sporting chance 
to finish. 

Also note that there is a 
deadline to register for 
classes (as in I can't take for¬ 
ever or else I would be past 

the deadline for enrollment). 

Fast forward to Monday, 
January 13, 2003. The fol¬ 
lowing is a re-telling of a day 
in the life of me: 

9:00 AM: zzzzzzzzzzz (did 
you actually think I would be 
awake?!?!) 

10:30 AM: getting ready 
for test by studying a lot of 
numbers. 

11:00 AM: sneaking into 
the cafe because if they are 
scanning cards I will not be 
able to get any food because 
I have STILL not been able 
to register. 

11:02 AM: safely eating in 
the cafe (they are still click¬ 
ing!) 

11:45 AM: leaving cafe to 
study more. 

12:30 PM: still studying 
and praying fervently to re¬ 
tain at least the ability to 
count higher than five... 

1:00 PM: taking final 
ALEKS exam. 

2:30 PM: finishing ALEKS 
exam and realizing that I now 
have a 74% instead of a 75%. 

2:32 PM: screaming in 
agony and despair. 

2:34 PM: still screaming 
2:40 PM: make an appoint¬ 

ment to take another assess¬ 
ment in a half hour to give me 
time to calm down (suppos¬ 
edly I am an alarming shade 
of puce). 

3:10 PM: checking school 
e-mail 

3:11 PM: realize that the 
math professor that I was 
supposed to have for Devel¬ 
opmental Math (if I was en¬ 
rolled, but I am still not), had 
the nerve to e-mail me and 
tell me that I have already 
missed class twice and that if 
I didn't go to class I would 
be in trouble... 

3:13 PM: throwing back¬ 
pack across the room because 
I can't believe that this pro¬ 
fessor had the nerve to e-mail 
when I am only ONE STU¬ 
PID POINT AWAY from fin¬ 
ishing. 

3:18 PM: taking another fi¬ 
nal ALEKS exam 

4:00 PM: finishing ALEKS 

exam 
4:01 PM: realizing that I 

now have a 76% and I am 
done with math 

4:02 PM: WOO-HOO!!!!!! 
4:15 PM: re-enrolling at 

good old TNU! 
So I was finally able to I 

pass my ALEKS final and 
was able to re-enroll here at 
TNU. I will never again have 
to log onto a computer and 
figure out percentages and 
divide fractions. 

But it is still my firm be¬ 
lief the remedial program 
here at TNU needs to be re¬ 
evaluated for the sake of all 
those poor innocent, incom¬ 
ing freshman who show up at 
computer labs on their first 
day and have to struggle with 
all the multiplying and con¬ 
verting and dividing and 
other icky math terms that I 
care not to know about for the 
rest of forever (that is, until I 
have to take Concepts of 
Math and Financial 
Stewardship...ugh). 

* 



Jan. 23- Thursday 
LEAD. 10:30AM 
Women’s Basketbal 
©Union University 
6PM 
Men’s Basketball 
@ Union University 
8PM 
Vienna Choir Boys 
Concert @ TCC 
7:30PM 

Jan. 24- Friday 
Friday Night Live 9 PM 

Jan. 25- Saturday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Freed-Hardeman 
University 2 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Freed-Hardeman 
University 4 PM 
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...continued from page one 

Multicultural Ministries to 
Revivalism, Sunday 
School, and The Hidden 
Mission Field. This is only 
a small portion of the many 
topics that will be covered. 
Overall, 160 workshops 
will be offered. 

Finally, on Tuesday 
evening, there will be a big 
pizza party for all college 
and career students attend¬ 
ing the conference. 

Many college students 
may thing, “How is a poor 
college student like me go¬ 
ing to be able to afford to 
attend this awesome 

event?” It’s all free. To reg¬ 
ister, simply go to the Mil¬ 
lennium Three website at 
www.m3conference.org 
and fill out a short registra¬ 
tion page. The website may 
also be used to check out the 
schedule of events for the 
conference. 

Coordinators of the con¬ 

ference are also looking for 
college students to volun¬ 
teer to help in coordinating 
the event. 

For more information on 
registering to be a partici¬ 
pant or to sign up to help as 
a volunteer contact Sharisa 
Brown at (615) 248-7377. 

Vienna Choir Boys keeps singing 

Social Life’s Milly Mobile keeps rolling 
...continued from page one 

old car, Social Life put their 
mark on it making it the first 
ever car owned by Trevecca 
Social Life. 

The Milly Mobile has 
been seen sitting in various 
places around campus 
proudly sporting the face of 
Trevecca’s own Dr. Millard 
Reed. 

Last semester, the Milly 

Mobile sat in front of 
Moore Gymnasium for the 
State Farm Nazarene Invi¬ 
tational Tournament where 
the Lady Trojans basketball 
team defeated three differ¬ 
ent Nazarene colleges in¬ 
cluding Olivet Nazarene 
University Point Loma 
Nazarene University, and 
MidAmerica Nazarene Uni¬ 
versity. 

The car, (seen in picture 

with Dr. Millard Reed on 
the front page) was origi¬ 
nally white, but once Social 
Life Committee member 
and Trevecca student Eli 
Hamilton got control of the 
car, the old Chavette was 
painted purple with gold 
rims and bumpers with a 
large portrait of President 
Reed's face painted on the 
hood. 

Freshman Alaina 
McKinney had this to say 
about the car, "I think it's 
great and really funny. 
They did a good job." 

Brandi Byler, also a fresh¬ 
man at Trevecca, said, "I 
think it's ghetto and that's 
all I have to say about that." 

President Reed laughed 
when asked to take a picture 
with the car, but was more 
than willing to participate. 

TNU anticipates M3 Conference 

Feb. 1- Saturday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Lyon College 2 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Lyon College 4 PM 

Feb. 3- Monday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Blue Mountain 
College 7 PM 

...continued from page 3 

as in North and South 
America. 

The choir visits the 
United States annually and 
now include Trevecca in 
their tour of the U.S. 

The Vienna Choir Boys 

have a long tradition of ex¬ 
cellence having worked 
with such celebrated musi¬ 
cians as Mozart, Schubert, 
and Haydn, among many 
others. The artistry of the 
choir is owed to Norbert 
Balatsch and Gerald Wirth. 

As a private, non-profit 

organization, the choir 
funds itself primarily 
through concerts and re¬ 
cordings. 

Tickets to see the Vienna 
Boys Choir at Trevecca 
Community Church of the 
Nazarene on Thursday, 
January 23 are available 

through the Office of 
Alumni Services which can 
be contacted at (615) 248- 
1350. 

Since tickets are limited, 
advance purchase is 
encouraged. However, any 
remaining tickets will be 
sold at the door. 

Feb. 6- Thursday 
L.E.A.D. 10:30 AM 
Women’s Basketball 
@ Lee University 5 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
@ Lee University 7 PM 

Krispy Kreme Doughnuts has extended their offer to Trevecca students for the spring semester. 
Present a valid TNU ID at the Krispy Kreme located at the comer of Nolensville Road and Thompson 
Lane and receive a dozen original glazed doughnuts free with the purchase of a dozen doughnuts. 
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Friday Night Live returns to TNU 

For over four years the 
campus of Trevecca 
Nazarene University has en¬ 
joyed an annual improv per¬ 
formance by students and 
faculty members that takes 
comedy to a whole new level. 
Based on the hit television 
show Saturday Night Live, 
Trevecca Social Life presents 
Friday Night Live every year 
much to the elation of eager 
Trevecca students. 

Skits ranging from Celeb¬ 
rity Jeopardy and Inspira¬ 
tional Talks from Matt Foley 
to the Crocodile Hunter and 
Brian Fellows have all be¬ 
come a part of the Friday 

Night Live festivities over 
the years. 

This year, Friday Night 
Live approaches with the 
same intensity and anticipa¬ 
tion. 

Lead by Trevecca Social 
Life Vice President David 
Graham and Social Life 
Committee member Aaron 
Shaver, Friday Night Live 
will offer several new skits 
this year. 

Skits this year will include 
a comical broadcast of the 
first ever baseball game, an 
inspirational talk from Matt 
Foley with a new cultural 
twist, Celebrity Jeopardy 
(Trevecca style), Weekend 
Update, and much more. 

Over the years, Celebrity 

Jeopardy and Weekend Up¬ 
date have been popular 
staples to the event. 

Celebrity Jeopardy has 
boasted Trevecca students 
posing as such stars as Sean 
Connery and Burt Reynolds. 
This year, students will retire 
the famous faces and, in¬ 
stead, pose as familiar 
Trevecca faculty members. 

Weekend Update, tradi¬ 
tionally a favorite amoung 
Friday Night Live skits, will 
feature the latest happenings 
and news reports of Trevecca 
events, always with comical 
commentary following. 

With an all-star cast of per¬ 
formers such as David 
Seamon, Aaron Shaver, Nate 
Owen, Natalie McMahon, 

Graham Hi, and much more, 
Friday Night Live looks to be 
a well-attended event with 
elevated expectations. 

The date for the highly an¬ 
ticipated event is Friday, 
January 24 at 9 PM. Tickets 
will be sold at the door and 
are free with a S.L.A.P. card 
or two dollars without the 
card. 

Traditionally, seats for the 
event are filled early so for 
best seating, the Social Life 
Committee suggests arriving 
at least fifteen minutes before 
showtime. 

For more information on 
the event or to join the So¬ 
cial Life Committee contact 
Vice President of Social Life 
David Graham at 248-7772. 

Internet dass helps timid students 
The Internet is has be¬ 

come an amazing resource 
for information about virtu¬ 
ally any topic anyone might 
be interested in. However, 
many people find themselves 
apprehensive about what to 
do and where to go on the net. 
Others find themselves afraid 
of trusting a computer or the 

Internet for business pur¬ 
poses. Still many others 
worry about keeping per¬ 
sonal information safe are or 
nervous about on-line scams. 

The Tennessee Christian 
Medical Center is providing 
a class, free of charge, in¬ 
tended to educate people on 
the truth about Internet 
safety. 

The Internet: Friend or 
Foe, is a free course being of¬ 
fered on Wednesday, January 
29, 2003, beginning at 1:30 
PM in Tennessee Christian’s 
Resource Center. Participants 
will learn about such things 
as privacy and safety on the 
Internet and dispelling 
Internet rumors. 

For more information or 
to register for the free class, 
call (615) 860-6600. Pre-reg¬ 
istration is preferred, but last 
minute guests are always 
welcome. Tennessee Chris¬ 
tian Medical Center is lo¬ 
cated off Old Hickory Bou¬ 
levard and Larkin Springs 
Road in Madison, Tennessee. 

WHAT DO YOU THINK? 
This is the section 

where students like you 
can speak out and give 
your opinion about some 
of life’s important issues 
and maybe even some of 
the not-so-important 
ones. Trevecca students 
can say whatever they 
want. So, with that said, 

TrevgmMm asks... 

“Who would you 
like to see as a 

chapel speaker?” 

“Professor Buess, he’s a 
cool guy. He’d be a good 

chapel speaker.” 

“Aaron Reynolds would 
make a great chapel 

speaker” 

“I want to see Lamar 
Courtney speak in 

chapel.” 

Upcoming 
events at 

TNU 
Feb. 7- Friday 
Phi Beta Lambda 
Event 7:30 PM 

Feb. 8- Saturday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Berry College 2 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Berry College 4 PM 

Feb. 10- Monday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Union University 
6PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Union University 
8PM 

Feb. 11- Tuesday 
College to Career Fair 
@ TN State Fair 
Grounds 11 AM- 5 PM 

Feb. 13- Thursday 
L.E.A.D. 10:30 AM 
Women’s Basketball 
@ Cumberland Univer¬ 
sity 6 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
@ Cumberland Univer¬ 
sity 8 PM 

Feb. 14- Friday 
Valentine’s Day 
Valentine’s Banquet 

Feb. 17-19 
Millennium Three 
Conference 

Feb. 17- Monday 
President’s Day 

Feb. 20-22 
TNU Drama Presents 
“The Tempest” 7 PM 

Feb. 20- Thursday 
Women’s Basketball 
@ Freed-Hardeman 
6PM 
Men’s Basketball 
@ Freed-Hardeman 
8pm 
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TNU Lady Trojans perfect at home 
Sports Calendar 
Jan. 23- Thursday 
Women’s Basketball 
@ Union University 
6 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
@ Union University 
8 PM 

Jan. 25- Saturday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Freed-Hardeman 
University 2 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Freed-Hardeman 
University 4 PM 

Jan. 27- Monday 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Cumberland Uni¬ 
versity 7 PM 

Jan. 30- Thursday 
Women’s Basketball 
@ Brescia University 
7 PM 

Feb. 1- Saturday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Lyon College 2 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Lyon College 4 PM 

Feb. 3- Monday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Blue Mountain 
College 7 PM 

Feb. 6- Thursday 
Women’s Basketball 
@ Lee University 5 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
@ Lee University 7 PM 

Feb. 8- Saturday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Berry College 2 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Berry College 4 PM 

Feb. 10- Monday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Union University 
6PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Union University 
8PM 

Dating back to last sea¬ 
son, the Trevecca women’s 
basketball team has won 12 
games in a row at home. 
The confines of Moore 
Gymnasium on the campus 
of Trevecca have proven to 
be an uninviting place to 
play for opponents with its 
surrounding bleachers and 
intimidating home crowd. 

As impressive as Moore 
Gymnasium may be, the 
Lady Trojans have had to 
earn their success this sea¬ 
son on the road. Almost 
two months have elapsed 
since the Trevecca women’s 
squad has played a home 
game. 

After chalking up home 
wins against several top 
NAIA schools in the first 
half of the season including 
a huge, three point upset of 
#1 ranked Southern 
Nazarene Univeristy, the 
Lady Trojans embarked on 
a six game road trip which 
was extended to seven 
games after the home game 
against Cumberland Uni¬ 
versity was postponed due 
to heavy snowfall. 

After suffering a loss 
from TranSouth Conference 
opponent Lyon College, the 

As fans look forward to this new 

spring season, I offer a moment to 

pause and reflect on the many accom¬ 

plishments that TNU athletics have 

reached thus far. 

With excitement and enthusiasm 

mounting toward the Lady Trojans 

strength on the court and the battle 

the men have in player eligibility, 

many achievements have gone unno¬ 

ticed. 

The volleyball team finished the 

fall season continuing a tradition of 

excellence under Head Coach Scott 

Jones. 

The team began the season with a 

tournament championship win at the 

Trevecca women's basket¬ 
ball team bounced back 
with a win against Martin 
Methodist College on Sat¬ 
urday evening in Trevecca’s 
final game of their extended 
road trip. The game began 
as a defensive battle as both 
teams struggled shooting 
from the field early on. The 
Lady Trojans only shot 
25.7% from the field in the 
first half, but thanks to their 
defense, Trevecca went into 
the locker room at half time 
deadlocked in a 28-28 tie. 

Asbury College Invitational and a 

second place finish at the Lee Uni¬ 

versity Invitational while afterwards 

defeating their crosstown rival, 

NCAA Division I opponent Tennes¬ 

see State University. 

The team climbed the stats and re¬ 

ceived bids for being in the top 25 of 

the NAIA coaches poll. 

Crissie Cunha, a 6'1" junior from 

Rio de Janeiro, Brazil, was named 

Asbury Tournament MVP and placed 

on the All-Tournament team at the 

Lee University Invitational. 

Freshman Laurel Markovich from 

Franklin, Tennessee was named the 

TranSouth Athletic Conference and 

Region XI setter of week and NAIA 

setter of the week as well as being 

named to the Asbury College Invita¬ 

tional All-Tournament team. 

In the second half, 
Trevecca found their 
rhythm once more as junior 
Lindsey Fly dropped in 21 
points and 11 rebounds to 
lead the Lady Trojans to a 
67-61 victory. Fly's stats 
were good enough for her 
8th double-double of the 
season. Senior Jennifer 
Wilson added 17 points and 
was a perfect 4 for 4 from 
the free throw line while 
freshman Kristin Scoggins 
tallied 7 points and 4 steals 

Katie Carter, a 6’0" senior also 

from Franklin, TN, provided a great 

amount of leadership for the team in 

continuing a level of strength and con¬ 

sistency. Carter was named to the All- 

Tournament team at the Asbury Col¬ 

lege Invitational and the Lee Univer¬ 

sity Invitational. 

The men's golf team continues 

their season this spring with five play¬ 

ers after losing two players for vari¬ 

ous reasons. 

The women's golf team also con¬ 

tinues this spring with many expec¬ 

tations and the potential for a very 

successful finish. 

The men’s and women's soccer 

team took remarkable strides this past 

fall and continue to build upon this 

season during the spring. 

The women's team, joined by new 

in the winning effort. 
The Lady Trojans im¬ 

proved to 14-2 on the sea¬ 
son and 1-1 in TranSouth 
Conference play. Trevecca 
will next travel to Jackson, 
TN to face #2 Union Uni¬ 
versity on Thursday, Jan 23 
at 6pm. 

Trevecca will finally re¬ 
turn home to defend their 
12 game home winning 
streak on Saturday, January 
25 at noon against Freed- 
Hardeman University. 

assistant coach Mark Champion, be¬ 

gan to build a new foundation when 

six players did not return this season. 

With five freshmen, including 

team MVP Casey Thornton, the squad 

began to take a new form under the 

leadership of captains Carolyn Pratt, 

junior, and Tawny Brown, senior. 

During the match against Fisk 

University, the Lady Trojan set the 

records for highest scoring during a 

match with a 19-0 win. 

Brown and teammate Tori Sanchez 

were named to the TranSouth Athletic 

All-Conference Team. 

Sophomore Lauren Collins was 

named Most Inspirational player 

while Seniors Leah Herod and Tawny 

Brown received the Coach's award for 

...continued on page 6 

Falling into spring 



Trojans upset #6 Martin Methodist 

Fall sports final recap 

Traveling down to Pulaski, 
Tennessee has never been a fun 
trip for the Trevecca men’s bas¬ 
ketball team. The past four years 
have resulted in four losses for the 
Trojans as they’ve taken the de¬ 
feat from Martin Methodist Col¬ 
lege on the RedHawk’s home 
floor consistently throughout the 
years. Last Saturday afternoon, 
however, the Trojans rewrote his¬ 
tory. 

With Martin Methodist College 
sporting a 10-2 overall record and 
a #6 ranking in the latest NAIA 
coaches poll, Martin Methodist 
came into the basketball game as 
huge favorites. 

The Trojans, on the other hand, 
had a tough opening half of the 
season losing several players to 
ineligibilty rules and playing a 
majority of their games with only 
eight players. Needless to say, 
Trevecca came into Martin Meth¬ 
odist College’s gymnasium with 
much to prove and the term “un¬ 
derdog” as an understatement. 

Someone forgot to tell the Tro¬ 
jans they were supposed to lose. 

Immediately off the jumpball, 
the Trojans exploded into an of¬ 
fensive display unexpected by the 
RedHawks. The ball bounced 
around after bein tipped out on the 
jumpball before Trojan senior 
Will Partin finally grabbed the 
loose ball and started a chain of 
events that dominated Martin 
Methodist. 

Two minutes later, Martin 
Methodist Head Coach Chuck 
Benson calls a desparation 
timeout, his team losing 10-0 and 
the home crowd sitting in stunned 
silence. The Trojans weren’t fin¬ 
ished yet. 

Led by 6’9” junior forward 
Marko Kandic who tallied 19 
points and 5 rebounds, the 
Trevecca men’s basketball team 
went on to shock the #6 team in 
the NAIA with a 69-57 win. 

Senior Darryl Keckler added 
16 points and 9 rebounds of his 
own in the winning effort while 
senior Jared Austin, coming off 
an injury that has sidelined him 
for almost three entire games, 
scored 11 points shooting a per¬ 
fect 5 for 5 from the field. 

The Trojans improve to 10-5 on 
the season and 1-0 in TranSouth 
Conference play. Trevecca will 
next travel to Jackson, TN to take 
on #30 Union University on 
Thursday, Jan. 23 at 8pm. 

...continued from page 6 
character and leadership. 

The men's soccer team finished the 

2002 fall season at 8-7-3 under Head 

Coach Stan Herod and Asst. Coach 

Tim Betts. Under the leadership of 

captains Johnathan Strickland and 

Matt Hurst, the men faced their great¬ 

est obstacle: team chemistry. 

With eight international players on 

the roster of twenty-six, the men had 

to leam not only how to interact and 

communicate with one another on the 

field, but to build a "team" off the 

field. 

The results of this growth were 

shown in their success. The men tied 

0-0 against #12 ranked Berry College 

and a win, 1-0 over rival Union Uni¬ 

versity. 

During the season Vinnie Bhaskar, 

a junior from Brisbane, Australia, was 

named Region XI player of the week 

and TranSouth Conference player of 

the week. Goal keepers Joe Shurm 

and Aaron Reynolds gave up only 16 

goals in 2002 and compiled eight 

shutouts. The team 2002 MVP went 

to Mariano Monzu and captains, 

Strickland and Hurst both tied as Most 

Inspirational player. Junior Esteban 

Gonzales receieved the Coach's 

Award for character and persever¬ 

ance. 

As TNU athletics fall into spring, 

many exciting and new developments 

are underway. Stay tuned to the 

Trevechoes for more information on 

all sports. 

TNU 
Sports Calendar 

Feb, 13- Thursday 
Women’s Basketball 
@ Cumberland Univer¬ 
sity 6 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
@ Cumberland Univer¬ 
sity 8 PM 

Feb. 20- Thursday 
Women’s Basketball 
@ Freed-Hardeman 
6PM 
Men’s Basketball 
@ Freed-Hardeman 
8pm 

Feb. 21- Friday 
Softball 
vs. Mountain State 
2 PM 

Feb. 22- Saturday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Martin Methodist 
College 2 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Martin Methodist 
College 4 PM 

Feb. 24- Monday 
Softball 
@ Campbellsville 
University 1 PM 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Cumberland Uni¬ 
versity 6 PM 

Feb. 27- Thursday 
Women’s Basketball 
vs. Lee University 
6 PM 
Men’s Basketball 
vs. Lee University 
8 PM 

Feb. 28- Friday 
Softball 
vs. Lindsey Wilson 
College 2 PM 
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Once upon an iceberg... 
by Billy Byler 

There comes a time in 
every man’s life when, after 
an overall rotten day filled 
with monotonous profes¬ 
sors, condescending bosses, 
and the everyday stresses of 
life, that only one thing can 
soothe his spirit, calm his 
nerves, and ease his mind. 

Such was the case not 
too long ago with my room¬ 
mate who, for purposes of 
anonymity, will be referred 
to as Rhett Butlerhiemer. 

My roommate, Rhett 
Butlerhiemer, after a rough 
day such as the one stated 
above, desired that one 
simple thing to give him rest 
and relaxation. He turned to 
me for the solution. 

“Billy,” said Rhett 
Butlerheimer as I sat in our 
room reading, “tell me a 
bedtime story.” 

Being the open, honest, 
typical male college student 
that I am, I proceeded to put 
down my book, tuck Rhett 
Butlerheimer into bed, then 
call everyone of his friends, 
laughing hysterically, tell¬ 
ing them what a wimp he 
was for wanting to hear a 
bedtime story like a big 
baby. 

When most of my 
wounds and cuts had 
stopped bleeding, Rhett 
climbed back into bed, still 
rubbing his recently used 
fists, and I proceeded to tell 
him a bedtime story. 

“Once upon a time,” I 
said, attempting to buy time 
to actually come up with 
something even resembling 
a plot. 

“No good,” said Rhett, 
“try something creative.” 

I took a deep breath, 
rebandaged my wounds, and 
began... 

“ Once upon an iceberg 
there lived a penguin. She 
was a pretty good penguin, 
as far as penguin behavior 
is concerned. She always 
did her penguin cleaning as¬ 
signments, went to penguin 
church, rarely violated her 
penguin curfew, and emp¬ 
tied her peguin trash can 

when needed. All the other 
penguins on her iceberg 
liked her, and, for the most 
part, she liked them too. 

Perhaps the most impor¬ 
tant thing in this penguin’s 
life was her penguin igloo. 
It was truly a beautiful 
sight. Located on the everso 
popular Johnson Iceberg, 
the igloo’s cubes of ice, per¬ 
fectly shaped, formed the 
outside of the arctic struc¬ 
ture while the inside was 
beautifully arranged with 
furniture that was securely 
bolted to the floor. Her ig¬ 

loo was connected with an 
adjoining igloo that shared 
a little penguin potty and 
penguin shower though that 
igloo was not as nicely 
decorated as the little 
penguin’s. 

Overall, this little pen¬ 
guin loved her igloo and 
held quite a bit of pride in 
her dwelling. She loved her 
igloo, that is, until the po¬ 
lar bears moved onto the 
iceberg. 

The polar bears, though 
seemingly nice mammals, 
had transfered in from a 
larger neighboring glacier 
that was state funded and 
had better facilities. 

The polar bears, despite 
only being able to slowly 
grunt and drink Coke, began 
to design their igloos in big¬ 
ger and better ways than the 
little penguin’s. One wild 
and crazy polar bear duo 
even went as far as mount¬ 
ing a TV to the inside of 
their igloo wall even though 
local building codes clearly 
stated that only sticky tack 
and other none corrosive 
substances were to be used 
on the igloo walls. 

The little penguin was 
appalled at such outlandish 

housing schemes. Soon, her 
igloo was the most simple 
and plain looking igloo on 
the entire iceberg. Although 
her igloo still gave her all 
the room and comfort she 
needed, the little penguin 
quickly grew jealous of the 
big polar bear igloos. 

One day, a traveling 
firewood, earmuff, and re¬ 
frigerator salesman made 
his way onto Johnson Ice¬ 
berg. He entered the iceberg 
on Sunday night from 8 PM 
to 11 PM and left his ID in 
the iceberg lobby so it was 

OK. 
This particular fire¬ 

wood, earmuff, and refrig¬ 
erator salesman was strik¬ 
ingly handsome despite an 
unseemly black eye and his 
inclination to tell corny 
jokes. In addition, like most 
any firewood, earmuff, and 
refrigerator salesman, he 
was very successful and had 
all the girls in high school 
known how successful he 
had become, they would 
probably hate themselves 
for calling him names, giv¬ 
ing him wedgies, and laugh¬ 
ing in his face every time he 
asked them to go to a school 
function with him. 

As the strikingly hand¬ 
some and somewhat corny 
firewood, earmuff, and re¬ 
frigerator salesman made 
his way down the iceberg, 
he came upon the little pen¬ 
guin. 

He displayed his prod¬ 
ucts for her but the penguin, 
still bitter about the whole 
polar bears with better ig¬ 
loos incident, didn’t pay 
much attention. Despite her 
lack of attentiveness, the 
little penguin, not wanting 
to hurt the salesman’s feel¬ 
ings, decided to buy some¬ 

thing. 
Looking at the products, 

the little penguin decided 
that, being on an iceberg, 
she didn’t have much use 
for a refrigerator. However, 
when she saw the firewood, 
and idea immediately came 
to her. 

Quickly, the little pen¬ 
guin bought up all the fire¬ 
wood her little penguin 
wings could carry and ran 
back toward her igloo, call¬ 
ing back to the firewood, 
earmuff, and refrigerator 
salesman, “Thank you so 
much! I would stay and buy 
some earmuffs from you, 
but as far as the narrator can 
tell, penguins don’t have 
ears. So he doesn’t think I 
would have much use for 
them.” And with that she 
bounded quickly toward her 
igloo. 

Once safely inside, she 
began to reveal her master 
plan. 

“I’ll show those transfer 
polar bears who has the best 
igloo! I’ll build a fireplace! 
That way, no matter how 
cool and big their igloos are, 
my igloo will be nice and 
warm, and everyone will 
envy me!” 

Immediately the little 
penguin built a roaring fire 
and soon was basking in the 
warmth around her. 

Unfortunately, her 
heated haven was short¬ 
lived as the heat from the 
fire began to melt the igloo! 
A small hole formed at the 
top of the igloo and the en¬ 
tire structure was fading 
fast! 

“Oh no!” thought the 
little penguin, “What will I 
do?” 

With no way of escap¬ 
ing, she quickly hid in a cor¬ 
ner. Suddenly, she realized, 
igloo’s don’t have corners! 
So she ran screaming and 
crying from her half melted 
house. 

Moments later, the last 
drop of igloo melted away 
and dropped on top of the 
firewood, extinguishing the 
flame. 

“What am I to do?” the 
little penguin cried, “I’ve 
lost everything!” 

Just then, the strikingly 
handsome an somewhat 
corny firewood, earmuff, 
and refrigerator salesman 
came walking up. Upon see¬ 
ing the devastation before 
him, the salesman had pity 
on the arctic ave and made 
her an offer. 

“Well, little penguin,” 
he said with wisdom beyond 
his years, “looks like you’ve 
gotten yourself into a mess. 
You had everything you 
needed, and yet you lost it 
all when you became too 
greedy for your own good.” 

“However, I have just 
the thing. There happens to 
be a place where you can 
stay that’s not too far away 
from your iceberg.” 

“Where is it?” asked the 
little penguin. 

“It’s actually, just a 
little ways down,” ex¬ 
plained the salesman, “on a 
place called Redford Gla¬ 
cier.” 

“Redford Glacier?” ex¬ 
claimed the little penguin, 
but that’s not an iceberg!” 

“No it isn’t.” said the 
salesman, “it’s much bigger 
than an iceberg, and it has a 
little peguin kitchen where 
you can use the oven to 
warm up, and you won’t 
have to worry about melting 
your igloo because it’s made 
of a combination of brick 
and concrete that, although 
it’s as ugly as a retarded ba¬ 
boon, won’t melt at all! In 
fact, you can stay there as 
long as you want.” 

“Forever?” asked the 
little penguin with Tim 
Green-like innocence. 

“Yes, forever.” an¬ 
swered the salesman, “Just 
remember, that’ll be $5,000 
per year plus a meal plan.” 

And they lived happily 
ever after. 

With that, Rhett 
Butlerheimer looked over at 
me, and with a groggy smile 
on his face said, “Byler, I’ll 
never ask you to tell me a 
bedtime story as long as I 
live.” 

With wide eyed inno¬ 
cence I looked up and asked, 
“Forever?” 

“Forever.” he said, and 
went to sleep. 

“Billy, ” said Rhett 
Butlerheimer as I sat in our 

room reading, “tell me a 
bedtime story. ” 


